
SR. NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION AMOUNT REMARKS

PART I SERVICE AREA 32,94,833.00         

PART II HOT KITCHEN 64,80,866.00         

PART III EXHAUST HOOD 25,30,699.00         

PART IV GRATING 18,63,147.00         

PART V BUTCHERY 1,52,256.00           

PART VI VEG PREPARATION 11,10,968.00         

PART VII COLD ROOM 12,00,125.00         

PART VIII FREEZER  ROOM 10,56,780.00         

PART IX MASALA SECTION 7,06,236.00           

PART X DISH WASH AREA 55,44,591.00         

PART XI POT WASH 48,06,075.00         

PART XII RECEIVING AREA 8,42,353.00           

PART XIII OIL STORAGE 98,090.00              

PART XIV GRAIN STORAGE 78,528.00              

PART XV DRY  STORAGE 7,43,791.00           

PART XVI WASTE BIN 2,44,782.00           

PART XVII WATER COOLER SECTION 53,898.00              

PART XVIII FIRST FLOOR  DRY  STORAGE 3,34,189.00           

PART XIX FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM 25,45,332.00         

PART XX MISCELLEANOUS 43,97,155.00         

TOTAL AMOUNT (WITHOUT GST) - 3,80,84,694        A

ADD GST @ 18% - 68,55,245           B

TOTAL AMOUNT INCLUDING GST 4,49,39,939         C=(A+B)

Name of Work :  THE SUPPLY, INSTALLATION, TESTING AND COMMISSIONING OF EQUIPMENT FOR 
KITCHEN AND DINING FACILITIES OF HOSTEL NO. 19 AT IIT BOMBAY

PART D-2 : ABSTRACT OF PRICE



ITEM NO
EQUIPMENT 

NO.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNITS QTY RATE-RS AMOUNT-RS

PART I SERVICE AREA

1 S1

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel HOT BAIN MARIE COUNTER WITH
HOT CASE BELOW of Size 1850 mm X (700+325) mm X
(850+ 550) mm with GN pans & Lids, Sneeze guard, water
chambers, perforated bottom selves, immersion heaters, tray
rails, legs and framework i/c connections etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 3                 1,44,524.00                 4,33,572.00 

2 S1A

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel HOT BAIN MARIE COUNTER of
Size 1850 mm X (700+325) mm X (850+ 550) mm with GN
pans & Lids, Sneeze guard, water chambers, perforated
bottom selves, tray rails, legs and framework i/c connections
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing

SET 2                 1,16,326.00                 2,32,652.00 

3 S1B

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel HOT BAIN MARIE COUNTER FOR
JAIN- of Size 2050 mm X (700+325) mm X (850+ 550) mm
with GN pans & Lids, Sneeze guard, water chambers,
perforated bottom selves, tray rails, legs and framework i/c
connections etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                 1,24,891.00                 1,24,891.00 

4 S2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
SALAD COUNTER of size 800 mm X (700+325) mm X (850+
550)mm with 2 no Under shelves, sneeze guard, tray rails,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                    73,486.00                 2,93,944.00 

5 S3

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
PLATE DISPENSING TABLE WITH 2 U/S of size 750 mm X
(700+325) mm X (850+ 550) mm with 2 no Under shelves,
Sneeze guard ,tray rails, legs and frame work etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 3                    46,581.00                 1,39,743.00 

6 S4

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
PLATE DISPENSING TABLE WITH 2 U/S of size 1050 mm X
(700+325) mm X (850+ 550) mm with 2 no Under shelves,
Sneeze guard ,tray rails, legs and frame work
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    58,824.00                    58,824.00 

7 S5

Supplying and placing of the CUTLERY BOX of minimum size
17’’ X 10½’’ X 3¾’’ made of ABS plastic having four
compartments on existing Plate Dispensing Table as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                      2,845.00                    11,380.00 

8 S6

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
WORK COUNTER WITH 2 U/S of size 1500 mm X (700+325)
mm X (850+ 550)mm with 2 no Under shelves, sneeze guard,
tray rails, legs and frame work etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    71,870.00                    71,870.00 

9 S7

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of CONVEYOR 
TOASTER of minimum capacity 1000 slices/hr suitable for
operation on 230 volts/50 Hz single phase A.C. supply i/c
connections etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                 3,34,119.00               13,36,476.00 

10 S8

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel TEA 
COFFEE STATION WITH 2 U/S of size 1250 mm X (700+325)
mm X (850+ 550) mm with 2 no Under shelves ,sunk in top,
sneeze guard, trail rails, legs and framework etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    61,214.00                    61,214.00 

11 S9

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
WORK COUNTER WITH 2 U/S of size 1350 mm X (700+325)
mm X (850+ 550)mm with 2 no Under shelves, sneeze guard,
tray rails, legs and frame work etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    68,604.00                    68,604.00 
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ITEM NO
EQUIPMENT 

NO.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNITS QTY RATE-RS AMOUNT-RS

12 S10

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of convection
type MICROWAVE of minimum 30 litres capacity with stainless
steel body suitable for operation on 230 volts/50 Hz single
phase A.C. supply i/c connections etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                    26,493.00                 1,05,972.00 

13 S11

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
WORK COUNTER WITH 2 U/S of size 1000 mm X 700 mm X
850mm with 2 no Under shelves, legs and frame work etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    42,869.00                    42,869.00 

14 S12

Supplying and placing custom fabricated Stainless Steel TRAY 
RACK FIVE SHELVES of size 900 mm X 700 mm X 1800 mm
made of 16 SWG sheet with 5 no Shelves etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 3                    45,938.00                 1,37,814.00 

15 S13

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
WORK COUNTER FOR TOASTER of size 1200 mm X 700
mm X 850mm with 2 no Under shelves, legs and frame work
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding

SET 1                    46,581.00                    46,581.00 

16 S14

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
WORK COUNTER FOR TOASTER of size 1800 mm X 700
mm X 850mm with 2 no Under shelves, legs and frame work
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding

SET 1                    56,361.00                    56,361.00 

17 S15

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
WORK COUNTER FOR MICROWAVE of size 730 mm X 600
mm X 850mm with 2 no Under shelves, legs and frame work
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding

SET 2                    36,033.00                    72,066.00 

              32,94,833.00 
PART II HOT KITCHEN

1 HK1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated double door stainless steel Vertical Freezer of 500
Ltrs. Capacity suitable for operation on 230 volts/50 Hz single
phase A.C. supply and having GN pans on angles, 8 no wire
shelves ,insulation, hermetically sealed compressor, legs and
drain plate i/c connections etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing. .The
internal temperature shall be maintained in the range of -18ᵒ C
to -22ᵒ C

SET 2                 1,03,657.00                 2,07,314.00 

2 HK2

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated double door stainless steel Vertical Refrigerator of
500 Ltrs. Capacity suitable for operation on 230 volts/50 Hz
single phase A.C. supply and having GN pans on angles, 8 no
wire selves, insulation, hermetically sealed compressor ,legs
and drain plate i/c connections etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing. The
internal  temperature shall be maintained in the
range of +4ᵒ C to +8ᵒ C

SET 2                    93,899.00                 1,87,798.00 

3 HK3

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
WORK TABLE WITH CROSS BRACING of size 1800 mm X
700 mm X (850+ 150) mm made up of 14 SWG sheet with
splash back and having Cross Bracing ,legs and frame work
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    30,056.00                    30,056.00 

4 HK4

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
Flour Bin on dolly of size 500 mm X 600 mm X 700 mm
having SS rod collapsable handle, castors
with brakes and frame work etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 3                    29,412.00                    88,236.00 

5 HK5

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
Masala Trolley of size 500 mm X 800 mm X 850 mm with 9
nos. GN pans, 1 no undershelf, castors with brakes - rubber
bumpers and frame work etc complete as per the
specifications  mentioned  in  the corresponding drawing

SET 2                    29,205.00                    58,410.00 

6 HK6

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of COMBI
OVEN 20 TRAY 1/1 GAS
SIZE: 879X931X1807MM -  
Capacity 20 x 1/1 GN,Number of meals per day 
150–300, Lengthwise loading 1/1, 1/2, 2/3, 1/3, 2/8 GN
Width 877 mm, Depth 913 mm, Height 1807 mm
Water inlet, R 3/4“, Water outlet DN 50 Water pressure 1,0 -
6,0 bar as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing..

SET 1               21,81,906.00               21,81,906.00 

TOTAL OF SERVICE AREA
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ITEM NO
EQUIPMENT 

NO.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNITS QTY RATE-RS AMOUNT-RS

7 HK6A

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of COMBI 
OVEN TROLLEY 201 SIZE:
561x824x1743MM o• Compatible with 201 combi ovens.•
Made from high grade stainless steel.
• The low rack height of no more than 1.60m allows the unit to
be loaded & unloaded quickly. Oversized, quiet & hygienic
tandem castors for easy movement.
• Standard 20 racks, 15 racks (84mm), 16 racks (80mm), 17
racks (74mm) or bakery standard options available as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing..

SET 2                 2,73,166.00                 5,46,332.00 

8 HK7

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel Tilting Bracing Pan of 150 liters
capacity  having tilting bracing pan
,control panel , 2 Nos. V-900 burner compatible with PNG gas,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                 2,60,199.00                 5,20,398.00 

9 HK7A

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel Tilting Bracing Pan of 80 liters
capacity  having tilting bracing pan
,control panel , 2 Nos. V-900 burner compatible with PNG gas,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                 2,15,989.00                 2,15,989.00 

10 HK8

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
MOBILE TABLE of size 800 mm X 750 mm X 850 mm with 2
no Undershelves ,legs with castors with brakes and frame
work etc  complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 3                    26,949.00                    80,847.00 

11 HK9

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size
800 mm X 800 mm X (850+150) mm with splash back having
sink of size 450 mm X 450 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer
basket, cross bracing, legs, frame works etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding

SET 1                    34,338.00                    34,338.00 

12 HK10

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of Stainless
Steel gas operated IDLI PLANT WITH STAND for steaming
minimum 300 Idli/ batch with gas pressure regulator, control
panel, suitable burner compatible with PNG gas, exhaust for
excessive heat and steam drain, legs and frame work etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    97,943.00                 1,95,886.00 

13 HK11

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
KITCHEN UTILITY TROLLEY of size 700 mm X 1050 mm X
1000 mm having 16 SWG SS tray type shelves, castors with
brakes-bumpers etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 3                    33,695.00                 1,01,085.00 

14 HK12

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of dual speed
DOUGH KNEADER CAP-40 KG (flour) capacity having
stainless steel heavy duty detachable and rotating drum along
with M.S angle frame work, control panel, motor and starter
suitable for operation on 415 volts/50 Hz 3- phase A.C. supply
i/c connections etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    86,779.00                 1,73,558.00 

15 HK13

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel DOSA PLATE WITH 1 U/S of size
1200 mm X 800 mm X (850+150) mm having 1 no Undershelf
with 4 nos V-600 burners , pilots and gas inlet at rear grease
collecting drawer, drip tray, griddle plate , grease trough, legs
and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                    48,971.00                 1,95,884.00 

16 HK14

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
WORK TABLE WIH 2 U/S of size 700 mm X 800 mm X
(850+150) mm with splash back ,having 2 no under-Shelves,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 3                    26,949.00                    80,847.00 

17 HK14A

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
WORK TABLE WIH 2 U/S of size 1000 mm X 800 mm X
(850+150) mm with splash back ,having 2 no under-Shelves,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    31,875.00                    31,875.00 

18 HK15

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
WORK TABLE WIH 2 U/S of size 1350 mm X 700 mm X
(850+150) mm with splash back ,having 2 no under-Shelves,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    36,728.00                    36,728.00 
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ITEM NO
EQUIPMENT 

NO.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNITS QTY RATE-RS AMOUNT-RS

19 HK16

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel 4 Burner gas Range of size 900 mm
X 900 mm X (850+150) having splash on rear side, front
control panel, drip tray, legs and frame work. It shall have 1 no. 
High pressure T-35 burner, 1 no. High pressure T-22 burner,
and 2 no. low pressure burners compatible with PNG gas etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing. It shall be provided complete
with gas connection and all accessories.

SET 1                    48,971.00                    48,971.00 

20 HK17

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size
900 mm X 700 mm X (850+150) mm with splash back having
sink of size 450 mm X 450 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer
basket, cross bracing, legs, frame works etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding

SET 1                    30,626.00                    30,626.00 

21 HK18

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel GN 
PAN TROLLEY of size 600 mm X 675 mm X 1800 mm with 20
pair of angles which are at 75 mm clear distance from each
other to hold 2 no. 1/1 gn
pans, castors with brakes etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    29,412.00                    29,412.00 

22 HK19

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated Stainless Steel CHAPATTI PLATE PUFFER WITH
1 U/S of size 1300 mm X 750 mm X (850 +150) mm having 1
Under shelve , Mild steel chapati plate of size 900 mm x 700
mm x 25 mm and Cast iron puffer plate of size 300 mm X 700
mm 40 mm. It shall have 2 nos. V- burners (V-750 mm & V-
600 mm long with pilot) compatible with PNG gas,, 1 no
underself ,Legs and frame work etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing. It shall
be provided complete with gas connection and all
accessories.

SET 3                    56,361.00                 1,69,083.00 

23 HK20

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
WORK TABLE WIH 2 U/S of size 750 mm X 750 mm X
(850+150) mm with splash back ,having 2 no under-Shelves,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 4                    26,949.00                 1,07,796.00 

24 HK21

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel SINGLE BURNER GAS RANGE of
size 900 mm X 900 mm X 550 mm with High pressure multi
ring burner compatible with PNG gas, gas inlet on both rear
sides, drip tray, legs and frame work etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing. It shall
be provided  complete  with  gas  connection  and  all
accessories.

SET 8                    37,978.00                 3,03,824.00 

25 HK21A

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of WALL 
MOUNTED POT FILLER having chrome plated brass body,
24" double joint swing nozzle, on-off volume control outlet with
insulated grip, 1/2" NPT female inlet etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 8                    31,460.00                 2,51,680.00 

26 HK22

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated Stainless Steel BULK KADAI UNIT of size 900 mm
X 900 mm X 550 mm having heavy duty MS frying Kadai, High
pressure multi ring burner compatible with PNG gas, gas inlet
on both rear sides, drip tray, legs and frame work etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing. It shall be provided complete with gas connection and
all accessories.

SET 1                    48,401.00                    48,401.00 

27 HK23

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
UTENSIL TROLLEY of size 900 mm X 900 mm X 500 mm
having removable tray, castors with breaks etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 4                    22,096.00                    88,384.00 

28 HK24

Supplying and Placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
MARBLE TOP CHAPATTI ROLLING TABLE ON WHEEL of
size 1500 mm X 900 mm X 850 mm having marble top,
crossing bracing, legs ,castors with brakes etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 3                    34,338.00                 1,03,014.00 

29 HK25

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size
1500 mm X 700 mm X (850+150) mm with splash back having
sink of size 450 mm X 450 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer
basket, cross bracing, legs, frame works etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding

SET 1                    39,192.00                    39,192.00 
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ITEM NO
EQUIPMENT 

NO.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNITS QTY RATE-RS AMOUNT-RS

30 HK26

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
WORK TABLE WIH 2 U/S of size 1800 mm X 800 mm X
(850+150) mm with splash back ,having 2 no under-Shelves,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    53,898.00                    53,898.00 

31 HK27

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel Tilting Rice Boiler of 160 Liters
capacity having tilting boiling pan with spring loaded and
insulated lid ,single swivel foucet, tilting mechanism with worm
gear, ignition aperture and 3 nos T-35 burners compatible with
PNG gas etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in
the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                 2,39,098.00                 2,39,098.00 

              64,80,866.00 
PART III EXHAUST HOOD

1 EX1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated EXHAUST HOOD WITH FRESH AIR FOR TILTING
PAN of size 10400 mm X 1400 mm X 600 mm made up of SS
304 body and having frame work, grease filter, bulk head lights
with fire proof wiring complete with all accessories for fixing the
hood from ceiling etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                 6,04,825.00                 6,04,825.00 

2 EX2

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated EXHAUST HOOD WITH FRESH AIR FOR
BOILING PAN of size 4800 mm X 1600 mm X 600 mm made
up of SS 304 body and having frame work, grease filter, bulk
head lights with fire proof wiring complete with all accessories
for fixing the hood from ceiling etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                 3,18,313.00                 3,18,313.00 

3 EX3

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated EXHAUST HOOD WITH FRESH AIR FOR IDLI &
BURNER of size 3500 mm X 1600 mm X 600 mm made up of
SS 304 body and having frame work, grease filter, bulk head
lights with fire proof wiring complete with all accessories for
fixing the hood from ceiling etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                 2,42,467.00                 2,42,467.00 

4 EX4

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated EXHAUST HOOD WITH FRESH AIR FOR SINGLE
BURNERS of size 10400 mm X 1500 mm X 600 mm made up
of SS 304 body and having frame work, grease filter, bulk
head lights with fire proof wiring complete with all accessories
for fixing the hood from ceiling etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                 6,61,113.00                 6,61,113.00 

5 EX5

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated EXHAUST HOOD WITH FRESH AIR FOR
CHAPATI PLATE of size 10400 mm X 1300 mm X 600 mm
made up of SS 304 body and having frame work, grease filter,
bulk head lights with fire proof wiring complete with all
accessories for fixing the hood from ceiling etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                 5,75,413.00                 5,75,413.00 

6 EX6

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated VAPOUR HOOD FOR DISH WASHER of size 3150
mm X 1000 mm X 600 mm made up of SS 304 body and
having frame work, grease filter, bulk head lights with fire proof
wiring complete with all accessories for fixing the hood from
ceiling etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing

SET 1                 1,28,568.00                 1,28,568.00 

              25,30,699.00 
PART IV GRATING

1 G1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
600 mm X 600 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 4                    17,169.00                    68,676.00 

2 G2

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
10800 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 3                 1,54,304.00                 4,62,912.00 

3 G3

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
6100 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    89,413.00                    89,413.00 

 TOTAL OF HOT KITCHEN

TOTAL OF EXHAUST HOOD
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ITEM NO
EQUIPMENT 

NO.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNITS QTY RATE-RS AMOUNT-RS

4 G4

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
11375 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                 1,64,083.00                 1,64,083.00 

5 G5

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
13800 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                 1,98,348.00                 1,98,348.00 

6 G6

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
3060 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    44,118.00                    44,118.00 

7 G7

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
3700 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 2                    53,898.00                 1,07,796.00 

8 G8

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
7650 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                 1,12,649.00                 1,12,649.00 

9 G9

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
5400 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    77,170.00                    77,170.00 

10 G10

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
1600 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 2                    22,666.00                    45,332.00 

11 G11

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
1200 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 6                    17,169.00                 1,03,014.00 

12 G12

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
2400 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 3                    34,338.00                 1,03,014.00 

13 G13

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
8000 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                 1,16,326.00                 1,16,326.00 

14 G14

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
3000 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    42,869.00                    42,869.00 

15 G15

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
1750 mm X 300 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    25,735.00                    25,735.00 

16 G16

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
2340 mm X 200 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    34,338.00                    34,338.00 

17 G17

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated GRATING WITH PERFORATED BASKET of size
4700 mm X 200 mm made up of SS 304 material etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                    67,354.00                    67,354.00 

TOTAL OF GRATING               18,63,147.00 
PART V BUTCHERY

1 B1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size
1100 mm X 600 mm X (850+150) mm with splash back having
sink of size 450 mm X 450 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer
basket, cross bracing, legs, frame works etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding

SET 1                    36,728.00                    36,728.00 
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2  B2

Supplying and placing of the GARBAGE BIN of 80 liters
capacity with diameter 440 mm (Top) and minimum height 700
mm as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                      7,996.00                      7,996.00 

3  B3

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated CHOPPING
BOARD STERLIZER of size 450 mm X 600 mm X 700 mm
made up of SS 304 material having chopping board stackers,
base frame, sink, cross bracing, legs castors with brakes and
frame work etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    26,949.00                    26,949.00 

4    B4

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
CHOPPING BLOCK of size 600 mm X 600 mm X 850 mm
with 75 mm chopping block thickness made up of Ferro nylon
material and having channel, cross bracing, legs and frame
work etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    29,412.00                    29,412.00 

5    B5

Supplying and placing of WEIGHING SCALE TABLE TOP 
having load capacity 30 Kg with accuracy of 1 gm and
stainless steel platform with minimum size of 215 mm X 265
mm suitable for operation on 230 volts/50 Hz single phase
A.C. supply having multifunction keyboard and other features
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing 

SET 1                      8,302.00                      8,302.00 

6    B6

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
WORK TABLE WIH 2 U/S of size 1750 mm X 600 mm X
(850+150) mm with splash back ,having 2 no under-Shelves,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    42,869.00                    42,869.00 

TOTAL OF BUTCHERY                 1,52,256.00 
PART VI VEG PREPARATION

1 VP1

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
MOBILE TABLE WITH 2 U/S of size 1500 mm X 800 mm X
850 mm with 2 no Undershelves ,legs with castors with brakes
and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 2                    41,655.00                    83,310.00 

2 VP2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
WORK TABLE WIH 2 U/S of size 1800 mm X 700 mm X
(850+150) mm with splash back ,having 2 no under-Shelves,
legs and frame work etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 3                    45,332.00                 1,35,996.00 

3 VP3

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size
1650 mm X 700 mm X (850+150) mm with splash back having
sink of size 450 mm X 450 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer
basket, cross bracing, legs, frame works etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding

SET 1                    41,655.00                    41,655.00 

4 VP4

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of VEG. 
PROCESSOR - ROBOT COUPE capable of continuous feed
slicing, dicing, shredding, grating, French fry and Julienne
supplied with hopper and standard set of discs for different
application, processing speed up to 550 Kg/hr, single speed,
340 ~ 375 RPM motor with power of 550 W suitable for
operation on 230 volts/50 Hz single phase
A.C. supply i/c connections etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                 2,65,361.00                 5,30,722.00 

5 VP5

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size
1800 mm X 700 mm X (850+150) mm with splash back having
sink of size 700 mm X 500 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer
basket, cross bracing, legs, frame works etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding

SET 1                    44,118.00                    44,118.00 

6 VP6

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated CHOPPING 
BOARD STERLIZER of size 600 mm X 600 mm X 700 mm
made up of SS 304 material having chopping board stackers,
base frame, sink, cross bracing, legs castors with brakes and
frame work etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    26,949.00                    26,949.00 

7 VP7

Supplying and placing of the GARBAGE BIN of 80 liters
capacity with diameter 440 mm (Top) and minimum height 700
mm as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                      7,996.00                      7,996.00 

8 VP8

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated STORAGE RACK
FIVE SHELVES of size 1000 mm X 600 mm X 1800 mm
having Five Shelves made up of 18 SWG SS 304 sheet
equidistant from each other, uprights with S.S. square pipes
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    31,875.00                    63,750.00 
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9 VP9

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated
ONION,COCONUT,POTATO BIN of size 750 mm X 700 mm X
1000 mm with 14 SWG SS top, 25 mm X 25 mm -14 SWG
wire mesh on all sides, cross bracings, Tray, castors with
brakes - bumpers and frame work etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                    44,118.00                 1,76,472.00 

TOTAL OF VEG PREPARATION               11,10,968.00 
PART VII COLD ROOM 

1 CR1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated COLD ROOM of size 4850 mm X 3350 mm X 2700
mm with internal desired temperature of +2ᵒC to +8ᵒC and
minimum refrigeration capacity 3 KW, Panel insulation i/c
connections etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                 8,52,145.00                 8,52,145.00 

2 CR2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
COLD ROOM RACK FIVE SHELVES of size 1500mm X 650
mm X 1800 mm having Five Shelves made up of 18 SWG
perforated sheet equidistant from each other, uprights and
frame work etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                    48,401.00                 1,93,604.00 

3 CR3

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
COLD ROOM RACK THREE SHELVES of size 1500mm X
650 mm X 1800 mm having Five Shelves made up of 18 SWG
perforated sheet equidistant from each other, uprights and
frame work etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    36,728.00                    36,728.00 

4 CR5

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
VEG RACK TROLLEY of size 500mm X 650 mm X 1850 mm
with 9 pairs of 35 mm X 35 mm X 14 SWG SS angles for
stacking of baskets, uprights, castors with brakes-bumpers
and along with 9 no crates etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    31,875.00                    63,750.00 

5 CR6

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel GN 
PAN TROLLEY of size 600 mm X 675 mm X 1800 mm with 20
pair of angles which are at 75 mm clear distance from each
other to hold 2 no. 1/1 gn
pans, castors with brakes etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing

SET 2                    26,949.00                    53,898.00 

TOTAL OF COLD ROOM               12,00,125.00 
PART VIII FREEZER  ROOM 

1 FR1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of FREEZER 
ROOM of size 2800 mm X 3350 mm X 2700 mm with internal
desired temperature of -24ᵒC to - 20ᵒC and minimum
refrigeration capacity 4.5 KW. Panel insulation and other
features shall be as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing. The freezer room shall be complete
with drainage, electrical system and other required
accessories.

SET 1                 8,79,020.00                 8,79,020.00 

2 FR2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
COLD ROOM RACK FIVE SHELVES of size 1200mm X 650
mm X 1800 mm having Five Shelves made up of 18 SWG
perforated sheet equidistant from each other, uprights and
frame work etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing.

SET 5                    35,552.00                 1,77,760.00 

TOTAL OF FREEZER  ROOM               10,56,780.00 
PART IX MASALA SECTION

1 MS1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated stainless steel WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size
1500 mm X 700 mm X (850+150) mm with splash back having
sink of size 450 mm X 450 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer
basket, cross bracing, legs, frame works etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding

SET 1                    36,728.00                    36,728.00 

2 MS2

Supplying and placing of the GARBAGE BIN of 80 liters
capacity with diameter 440 mm (Top) and minimum height 700
mm as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                      7,996.00                      7,996.00 

3 MS4

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of Tiltable WET 
MASALA GRINDER of capacity 25 Kg made up of SS 304
grade material with 3. KW electric motor and starter suitable
for operation on 3-phase,415 volts,50 Hz A.C. supply, cross
bracing and frame work i/c connections etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                 1,59,739.00                 3,19,478.00 
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4 MS5

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of
PULVERISER (7.5 HP) made up of SS 304 grade material
with directly coupled 3 phase electric motor and starter suitable 
for operation on 3-phase,415 volts,50 Hz A.C. supply, powerful
crusher with doors, container, control panel,1 no GN container,
cross bracing and frame work i/c connections etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    61,214.00                 1,22,428.00 

5 MS6

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of POTATO 
PEELER of 20 Kg capacity made up of SS304 grade material
having SS drum, sproutlid, lockable lid, sunk on top , legs,
frame work, control panel and motor with starter suitable for
operation on 3-phase,415 volts,50 Hz A.C. supply i/c
connections etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned  in  the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    53,898.00                 1,07,796.00 

6 MS7

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated Stainless steel POTATO PEELING SINK of size
600 mm X 600 mm X 600 mm with Sink of size 500 mm X 500
mm X 400 mm deep, strainer basket, legs, cross bracing,
frame work, castors with brakes & bumpers i/c connections etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    24,486.00                    48,972.00 

7 MS8

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of WALL 
MOUNTED POT FILLER having chrome plated brass body,
18" double joint swing nozzle, on-off volume control outlet with
insulated grip, 1/2" NPT female inlet etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing. 

SET 2                    31,419.00                    62,838.00 

TOTAL OF MASALA SECTION                 7,06,236.00 
PART X DISH WASH AREA

1 DW1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated SOILED DISH RECEIVER WITH OHS of size 2000
mm X 800 mm X (850+500) mm made of SS 304 grade
material with sunk in top, cross bracing, legs and frame work
etc complete including connections as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    42,869.00                    42,869.00 

2 DW2

Supplying and placing of the GARBAGE BIN of 80 liters
capacity with diameter 440 mm (Top) and minimum height 700
mm as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 2                      7,996.00                    15,992.00 

3 DW3

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated SS 304 ENTRY TABLE THREE SINK of size 1800
mm X 700 mm X (850+250) mm with splash back, 16 SWG 3
no Sinks in top of size 450 mm X 450 mm X300 mm deep,
strainer basket, cross bracing ,legs and frame work i/c
connections etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing

SET 1                    51,435.00                    51,435.00 

4 DW4

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of HAND 
SPRAY T&S 6" to 8'' deck mount mixing faucet with polished
chrome plated brass body, 21" to 24'' riser, minimum 36"
flexible stainless steel hose, heat resistant handle, 1.15 GPM
spray valve, compression cartridges with spring checks, lever
handles, 1/2" NPT female inlets, 6" adjustable wall bracket
including connections as per the specifications mentioned in
the corresponding drawing. 

SET 1                    33,089.00                    33,089.00 

5 DW6

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of DISH 
WASHER WITH DRYER TR600 WORKING DIRECTION
RIGHT TO LEFT having theoretical Rack capacity / hr of
125/190/250 with 3 transport speeds for racks of dimension
500 mm X 500 mm suitable for operation on 440 volts 3-phase
A.C. supply. It shall be complete with plumbing, drainage,
electrical system and other accessories i/c connections
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1               46,43,524.00               46,43,524.00 

6 DW6A

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of Ion exchange
resin type SOFTNER (CANATURE CS15H- 1035) compatible
with dish washer machine suitable for 230 volts/50 Hz single
phase A.C supply including connections etc complete as per
the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                 1,01,163.00                 1,01,163.00 

7 DW7

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
EXIT TABLE WITH STACKER of size 1550 mm X 700 mm X
850+250 mm with 14 SWG sheet sunk in top with splash back,
cross bracings, angles, legs and frame work etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    36,728.00                    36,728.00 
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8 DW7A

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
WORK TABLE WITH CROSS BRACING of size 600 mm X
700 mm X (1150+ 150) mm made up of 14 SWG sheet with
splash back and having Cross Bracing ,legs and frame work
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing

SET 1                    12,243.00                    12,243.00 

9 DW8

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
STORAGE RACK FIVE SHELVES of size1200 mm X 600 mm
X 1800 mm with 5 no shelves of 18 SWG sheet equidistant
from each other ,uprights with adjustable nylon bullet feet etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 4                    35,552.00                 1,42,208.00 

10 DW8A

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
STORAGE RACK FIVE SHELVES of size950 mm X 600 mm
X 1800 mm with 5 no shelves of 18 SWG sheet equidistant
from each other ,uprights with adjustable nylon bullet feet etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    30,626.00                    30,626.00 

11 DW9

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated CHEMICAL 
CUPBOARD STORAGE FIVE SHELVES of size 1200 mm X
600 mm X 1800 mm having five shelves made up of 16 SWG
SS sheet
,2  no  doors,  castors  with  brake  &  bumpers  etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    79,597.00                    79,597.00 

12 DW10

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated THALI TROLLEY
of size (1650+100) mm X 475 mm X 1450 mm with 16 SWG
SS top and 50 nos. 6 mm SS solid holding rod at 32 mm
distance between two rods to hold thali tray, S.S. round
handle, S.S plates fixed to castors, castors with brakes and
bumpers etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in  the corresponding drawing.

SET 5                    51,435.00                 2,57,175.00 

13 DW11

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated TIFFIN TROLLEY
of size (1100+100) mm X 600 mm X 1250 mm made up of 34
nos. 6 mm SS solid holding rod at 32 mm distance between
two rods to hold thali tray, S.S. round handle, S.S plates fixed
to castors, castors with brakes and bumpers etc complete
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 2                    48,971.00                    97,942.00 

TOTAL OF DISH WASH AREA               55,44,591.00 
PART XI POT WASH

1 PW3

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of WALL 
MOUNTED MIXING FAUCET- 8" Wall Mount Mixing Faucet,
Quarter-Turn Ceramic Cartridges, equip Lever Handles,12"
equip Swing Nozzle & 1/2" NPT Female Inlets as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    16,412.00                    32,824.00 

2 PW4

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated POT RACK FOUR
SHELVES of size 1500 mm X 800 mm X 1650 mm having four
shelves made up of SS 304 grade material with round pipes
for intercross, supports and upright etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 6                    44,118.00                 2,64,708.00 

3 PW5

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of POT 
WASHER- compact edition /flow edition /free flow edition
weight ( filled/ empty) 666 kg/485 kg
wash tank volume : 165 liters rinse water volume : 7 liters (eco
programme) 14 liters (short /normal programme) granule
volume : 16 liters
max. / normal capacity per hour : 192/136 (compact) /192/144
(normal capacity incl. handling) (flow)/ 192/160 (free flow)
capacity per programme : 8 gn 1/1 or up to 16 gn 1/2 or 4 gn
2/1 up to 200 mm depth or similar in other pots. as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing. 

SET 1               40,40,133.00               40,40,133.00 

4 PW6

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of POT
WASHER TROLLEY - cassette size :- 640x700x1100mm
trolley size :- 610x1141x1365mm
cassette trolley. art no. 22845 for operation of multi-cassette.
multi-cassette for granule maxi flow/ freeflow. art no. 14469 for
8 gn 1/1 containers or 4 gn 2/1 or equivalent in other
washware. as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing. 

SET 2                 2,34,205.00                 4,68,410.00 

TOTAL OF POT WASH               48,06,075.00 
PART XII RECEIVING AREA 
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1 R1

Supplying and placing of Heavy duty platform WEIGHING 
SCALE FLOOR MODEL upto150 Kg load capacity with
accuracy of 10 gm and Stainless steel platform of minimum
size 400 mm X 500 mm suitable for operation on 230 volts/50
Hz single phase A.C. supply i/c connections etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    15,654.00                    15,654.00 

2 R2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
KITCHEN UTILITY TROLLEY of size 900 mm X 750 mm X
1000 mm with 16 SWG SS tray type shelves, castors with
brakes-bumpers etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    28,198.00                    56,396.00 

3 R3

Supplying and placing o f custom fabricated Stainless steel
PLATFORM TROLLEY of size 1200 mm X 750 mm X 900 mm
with 16 SWG SS base and 1½'' diameter SS pipe handle
,frame work, castors with brakes-bumpers etc complete as per
the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    19,632.00                    39,264.00 

4 R4

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of VEGETABLE 
WASHER TILTING :-                      total watts: 1.6kw
usable well capacity:500liters
load per cycle –leafy vegetables:14kg 
load per cycle –heavy vegetables:70kg 
external dimensions: length:1500
external dimensions: width:877
external dimensions: height:845
shipping weight : 250 kg

as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing. 

SET 1                 6,88,705.00                 6,88,705.00 

5 R5

Supplying and placing of the GARBAGE BIN of 80 liters
capacity with diameter 440 mm (Top) and minimum height 700
mm as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 1                      7,996.00                      7,996.00 

6 R6

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
WORK TABLE WITH SINK of size 1400 mm X 600 mm X
(850+150) mm with 14 SWG Stainless steel top with splash
back and Ø200 mm cut out for garbage chute on LHS, sink of
size 650 mm X 450 mm X 300 mm deep, strainer basket,
frame work, legs and cross bracings i/c connections etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing

SET 1                    34,338.00                    34,338.00 

TOTAL OF RECEIVING AREA                 8,42,353.00 
PART XIII OIL STORAGE

1 OS1

Supplying and placing custom fabricated OIL PALLET TWO
TIERS of size 1400 mm X 750 mm X 1200 mm made up of 25
mm x 25 mm stainless steel square pipes at 75 mm distance
from each other. It shall also be provided with 16 SWG SS oil
drip tray, castors with brakes etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 3                    20,846.00                    62,538.00 

2 OS2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
STORAGE RACK FIVE SHELVES of size 1200 mm X 600
mm X 1800 mm with 5 no shelves of 18 SWG sheet
equidistant from each other ,uprights with adjustable nylon
bullet feet etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in
the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    35,552.00                    35,552.00 

TOTAL OF OIL STORAGE                    98,090.00 
PART XIV GRAIN STORAGE

1 GS1

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated GRAIN PALLET of
size 2000 mm X 1050 mm X 300 mm with 14 SWG stainless
steel corner pieces(150mm X 150 mm) and 25 mm X 25 mm
SS square pipes at 75 mm distance from each other, legs with
nylon bullet feet etc complete as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 4                    19,632.00                    78,528.00 

TOTAL OF GRAIN STORAGE                    78,528.00 
PART XV DRY  STORAGE

1 ST1

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of CHEST 
FREEZER of minimum 285 liters capacity and internal
Temperature Range of -24ᵒC to + 8ᵒC, suitable for operation
on 230 volts/50 Hz single phase A.C. supply i/c connections
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    32,481.00                    64,962.00 

2 ST2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
STORAGE RACK FIVE SHELVES of size 1050 mm X 600
mm X 1800 mm with 5 no shelves of 18 SWG sheet
equidistant from each other ,uprights with adjustable nylon
bullet feet etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in
the corresponding drawing.

SET 8                    31,875.00                 2,55,000.00 
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3 ST3

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
STORAGE RACK THREE SHELVES of size 1500 mm X 600
mm X 1800 mm with 3 no shelves of 18 SWG sheet
equidistant from each other ,uprights with adjustable nylon
bullet feet etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in
the corresponding drawing.

SET 3                    36,728.00                 1,10,184.00 

4 ST4

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated STAINLESS
STEEL BIN ON DOLLEY of size 400 mm X 500 mm X 750 mm 
with 16 SWG SS 304 bin and lid castors,collapsible
handles, SS plate, frame work and castors with brakes etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing

SET 9                    26,949.00                 2,42,541.00 

5 ST5

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
STORAGE RACK FIVE SHELVES of size 1200 mm X 600
mm X 1800 mm with 5 no shelves of 18 SWG sheet
equidistant from each other ,uprights with adjustable nylon
bullet feet etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in
the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    35,552.00                    71,104.00 

TOTAL OF DRY  STORAGE                 7,43,791.00 
PART XVI WASTE BIN

1 WB2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless steel
BUSSING TROLLEY of size 1050 mm X 700 mm X 1000 mm
with 14 SWG SS 304 top tray type shelve, 2 nos. 16 SWG SS
removable tray of size 300 mm X 600 mm X 150 mm & 600
mm X 600 mm X 150 mm and 16 SWG SS tray type bottom
shelves, handle, SS plate and castors with brakes etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 6                    35,552.00                 2,13,312.00 

2 WB3

Supplying and placing of Heavy duty platform WEIGHING 
SCALE FLOOR MODEL upto150 Kg load capacity with
accuracy of 10 gm and Stainless steel platform of minimum
size 400 mm X 500 mm suitable for operation on 230 volts/50
Hz single phase A.C. supply i/c connections etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    15,735.00                    31,470.00 

TOTAL OF WASTE BIN                 2,44,782.00 
PART XVII WATER COOLER SECTION 

1 WC1

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated stainless steel
GLASS MOBILE TABLE of size 900 mm X 600 mm X 850
mm with 2 no Undershelves ,legs with castors with brakes and
frame work etc complete as per the specifications mentioned
in the corresponding drawing 

SET 2                    26,949.00                    53,898.00 

TOTAL OF WATER COOLER SECTION                    53,898.00 
PART XVIII FIRST FLOOR  DRY  STORAGE

1 STF1

Supplying and placing of Heavy duty platform WEIGHING 
SCALE FLOOR MODEL upto150 Kg load capacity with
accuracy of 10 gm and Stainless steel platform of minimum
size 400 mm X 500 mm suitable for operation on 230 volts/50
Hz single phase A.C. supply i/c connections etc complete as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 1                    15,735.00                    15,735.00 

2 STF2

Supplying and placing of custom fabricated Stainless Steel
STORAGE RACK FIVE SHELVES of size 1200 mm X 600
mm X 1800 mm with 5 no shelves of 18 SWG sheet
equidistant from each other ,uprights with adjustable nylon
bullet feet etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in
the corresponding drawing.

SET 7                    35,552.00                 2,48,864.00 

3 STF3

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of CHEST 
FREEZER of minimum 285 liters capacity and internal
Temperature Range of -24ᵒC to + 8ᵒC, suitable for operation
on 230 volts/50 Hz single phase A.C. supply i/c connections
etc complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    34,795.00                    69,590.00 

TOTAL OF FIRST FLOOR  DRY  STORAGE                 3,34,189.00 
PART XIX FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM

1 FA1

Supply, Installation, testing and commissioning of EXHAUST 
HOOD FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM
HOOD NO - EX1,EX2,EX3.EX4 & EX5, with wet chemical
agent with both automatic actuation and manual actuation
system through a pull station. The system including all of its
components, shall be UL listed. The system shall be complete
with all components like supply and actuation unit including
manual pull station, control panel, Heat detection system,
Extinguishing installations like nozzle for ranges, plenum and
cut off, SS pipe fittings, etc. The system should also generate
Audio Visual alarm in case of fire etc complete as required.
The system should provide 100% protection as required

SET 1               25,45,332.00               25,45,332.00 

TOTAL OF FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM               25,45,332.00 
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PART XX MISCELLEANOUS 

1 M2

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of zapper PEST-
O-FLASH with minimum 2 no. of UV tubes of wattage 15 W-20 
W/tube, 17'' ~ 24'' long tube enclosed in powder coated GI
body, suitable for operation on 230 volts/50 Hz single phase
A.C. supply i/c connections etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 14                    12,015.00                 1,68,210.00 

2 M3

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of custom
fabricated Stainless steel knee operated HAND WASH SINK
of size 450 mm X 375 mm X (225+150) mm with splash back
having 16 SWG SS sunk in top of size 300 mm X 225 mm X
200 mm deep i/c connections etc complete as per the
specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 5                    18,383.00                    91,915.00 

3 M3A

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of HAND 
DRYER Construction : Stainless Steel # 304, Matt Finish
Mounting : Wall Mounted Operation : Automatic, Hand Dry
Time : 9S, Auto Cutoff : 60 seconds, Noise Leve : 60-
70db,Motor : brush motor
Speed : 30000r/min,Voltage : 220-240V,Rated Power :
1000W,Current : 6A,Protection  : IPx4
as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 5                    23,016.00                 1,15,080.00 

4 M4

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of AIR 
CURTAIN of width 1800 mm with 10-12 m/s air velocity, noise
level < 75 db, Stainless Steel body including connections as
per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    53,824.00                 1,07,648.00 

5 M5

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning HIGH 
PRESSURE CLEANING MACHINE with flow rate of 600 LPH
and pressure of 130 bar with ceramic plunger triplex pump with
all standard set of accessories, suitable for operation on 230
volts/50 Hz single phase A.C. supply i/c connections etc
complete as per the specifications mentioned in the
corresponding drawing.

SET 2                 9,74,915.00               19,49,830.00 

6 M6

Supply, Installation, Testing & Commissioning of HOSE REEL -
Enclosed stainless steel hose reel, stainless steel rear trigger
watergun and swivel with 5/16" orifice, 3/8" x 50' heavy-duty
non-marking hose, ratcheting system, multi-fit bracket,
adjustable hose bumper and 3/8" NPT female inlet.
• Pressure Max: 125 psi (8.62 bar)
• Pressure Min: 20 psi (1.38 bar)
• Temperature Max: 200 F (93.33℃)
• Temperature Min: 40 F (4.44℃)
• Water Gun Flow: 3.7 GPM (14.00 L/min)

as per the specifications mentioned in the corresponding
drawing.

SET 2                 2,26,397.00                 4,52,794.00 

7 M9

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of WATER 
COOLER 60 LTR of size 500 mm X 500 mm X 1050 mm
Brand Ezyfrost, Storage Capacity 100L, Body Material
Stainless Steel
Voltage 230V / 50Hz, Power 535W, Temp. Range 6 Degree,
Taps 1, Climate Class 42 DegreeC
Country of Origin Made in India as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 29                    47,428.00               13,75,412.00 

8 M10

Supply , Installation, Testing & Commissioning of WATER 
COOLER 100 LTR of size 700 mm X 500 mm X 1200 mm
Brand Ezyfrost, Storage Capacity 100L, Body Material
Stainless Steel
Voltage 230V / 50Hz, Power 535W, Temp. Range 6 Degree,
Taps 2, Climate Class 42 DegreeC
Country of Origin Made in India as per the specifications
mentioned in the corresponding drawing.

SET 2                    68,133.00                 1,36,266.00 

TOTAL OF MISCELLEANOUS               43,97,155.00 
Total Amount -Rs 3,80,84,694             TOTAL
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